
 
From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
To: “Craig L Martin”<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Wednesday, July 26, 2012, 10:12 
Subject: YOU WILL HEAR FROM OUR ATTORNEY. 
 
 
Mr Martin, 
 
We are informing you that we have reach the end of our patience in this matter, since all our effort 
to resolve your past due account, no payment has been made till date. You will hear from our lawyer 
in the United State as soon as we get one and legal action will be taken against your company, as 
you well know, such an action may adversely affect your credit rating. 
 
 
Sincerely yours, 
 
 
 
Anton Affentranger 
Chief Executive officer 
Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon 
Switzerland 
 
 
 
 
 
 
From: Craig L Martin <clmartin@jeci.biz> 
To: “Anton Affentranger”<aaf@implenia.com> 
Sent: Monday, July 2, 2011, 9:00 
Subject: Re: Collection Letter. 
 
Dear Anton, 
 
 
We apologies for the difficulties we put you and your company,  
we are doing everything possible to make sure these funds get to you, please bear 
with us.  
 
Thank you. 
 
 
Craig L Martin 
Chief Executive Officer and President  
Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc. 
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From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
To: “Craig L Martin”<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Thursday, June 21, 2012, 10:12 
Subject: Collection Letter. 
 
 
Hello Mr Martin, 
 
All our efforts to settle this matter amicably have been unsuccessful. We have made numerous calls 
to date, and have not had the courtesy of a call back. We have delayed legal proceedings up to 
now.Please be advised that you have left us no alternative but to file lawsuit immediately against 
you and your company. We have attempted to be understanding of your cash flow problems as you 
stated but our patience has now reached an end. This matter is being turned over to our attorney. 
 
Regards, 
 
 
Anton Affentranger 
Chief Executive officer 
Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon 
Switzerland 
 
 
 
 
 
 
From: Craig L Martin <clmartin@jeci.biz> 
To: “Anton Affentranger”<aaf@implenia.com> 
Sent: Thursday, June 7, 2011, 2:21 
Subject: Re: Final warning. 
 
 
Mr Affentranger, 
 
We are doing everything possible to ensure that these funds get to you, please give us 2 more weeks 
to make amends, we promise to have your funds forwarded to you. 
 
 
Thank you. 
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Craig L Martin 
Chief Executive Officer and President  
Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc. 
 
 
 
 
 
From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
To: “Craig L Martin”<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Friday, June 1, 2012, 9:02 
Subject: Final warning. 
 
 
Mr Martin, 
 
We have repeatedly advised you of your long overdue balance in the amount of $676,941.74. 
We have turned this matter over to our attorney and instructed them to commence suit without 
further delay. There is still time, however, to avoid suite, contact us within the next 7 working days. 
 
 
Yours sincerely,  
 
Anton Affentranger 
Chief Executive officer 
Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon  
Switzerland. 
 
 
 
From: Craig L Martin <clmartin@jeci.biz> 
To: “Anton Affentranger”<aaf@implenia.com> 
Sent: Thursday, April 19, 2011, 5:38 
Subject: Re: Notice of lawsuit. 
 
 
Anton, 
 
 
The reason for this delay is due to the economic situation of the country presently. 
We promise to have payments sent to your company not later than 30th of May 2012. 
Bear with us as we wish to resolve this issue amicably. 
 
 
 
Thank you. 
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Craig L Martin 
Chief Executive Officer and President  
Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
From: Craig L Martin <clmartin@jeci.biz> 
To: “Anton Affentranger”<aaf@implenia.com> 
Sent: Thursday, April 19, 2011, 9:16 
Subject: Re: Notice of lawsuit. 
 
Dear Mr Affentranger, 
 
How are you today? 
 
We are having our board meeting in 2 hours’ time, I promise to write you an email once am out, to 
give you proper explanation why things have been this way. Please do not proceed with litigation, as 
we hope to resolve this matter soonest. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
 
Craig L Martin 
Chief Executive Officer and President  
Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc. 
 
 
 
 
From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
To: “Craig L Martin”<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Tuesday, April 17, 2012, 9:59 
Subject: Notice of Lawsuit. 
 
 
Mr Martin, 
 
We have been patient enough. You have to be specific of when our funds will get 
Us. 
 
 
Regards, 
 
 
Anton Affentranger 
Chief Executive officer 
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Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon  
Switzerland. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
From: Craig L Martin <clmartin@jeci.biz> 
To: “Anton Affentranger”<aaf@implenia.com> 
Sent: Thursday, April 12, 2011, 1:16 
Subject: Re: Notice of lawsuit. 
 
 
Dear Affentranger, 
 
We are deeply sorry for the inconvenience this is cursing you and your company; however, we are   
working on getting these funds to your company. Give us more time please. 
 
 
 
Thank you. 
 
Craig L Martin 
Chief Executive Officer and President  
Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
To: “Craig L Martin”<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Monday, April 9, 2012, 9:34 
Subject: Notice of Lawsuit. 
 
 
Martin, 
 
All our efforts to settle this matter amicably have been unsuccessful. We have made numerous calls 
to date, and have not had the courtesy of a call back. We have delayed legal proceedings up to now 
base on your assurances that we would be paid in full by 23rd March 2012.Please be advised that you 
have left us no alternative but to file lawsuit immediately against you and your company. We have 
attempted to be understanding of your cash flow problems as you stated but our patience has now 
reached an end. This matter is being turned over to our attorney. 
 
Regards, 
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Anton Affentranger 
Chief Executive officer 
Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon 
Switzerland. 
 
 
 
 
From: Craig L Martin <clmartin@jeci.biz> 
To: “Anton Affentranger”<aaf@implenia.com> 
Sent: Thursday, February 16, 2011, 11:16 
Subject: Re: Reminder 
 
Anton, 
 
On behalf of Jacobs engineering group Inc., we apologies for the difficulties we put you and your 
company, the reason for this delay, is due to the economic situation of the country presently. We 
promise to have payments sent to you not later than 23rd of March 2011 
 
Thank you for your patience. 
 
 
Craig L Martin 
Chief Executive Officer and President  
Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc. 
 
 
 
From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
To: “Craig L Martin”<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Wednesday, February 15, 2012, 9:11 
Subject: Reminder. 
 
Craig L Martin, 
 
This is a reminder for the repayment of the loan of $676,941.74usd due on the 3rd of December 2011 
to our company. Please send us payment promptly. 
 
Sincerely yours, 
 
 
 
Anton Affentranger 
Chief Executive officer 
Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon 
Switzerland. 
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From: Craig L Martin <clmartin@jeci.biz> 
To: “Anton Affentranger”<aaf@implenia.com> 
Sent: Monday, January 18, 2011, 3:22 
Subject: Re: Reminder. 
 
 
We are deeply sorry for the delay we have caused; we want to assure you that we are going to have 
your funds sent as soon as we can; we assure you that you would have your funds in less than 10 
working days. 
 
Thank you for your understanding. 
 
 
Craig L Martin 
Chief Executive Officer and President  
Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc. 
 
 
 
From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
To: “Craig L Martin”<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Wednesday, January 18, 2012, 9:00 
Subject: Reminder. 
 
Mr Martin, 
 
Am writing to remind you of the loan payment of $676,941.74USD, due on the 3rd of December 
2011, we value our relationship with your company and hope to keep it that way, however, we do 
require that this payment be made immediately. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
Anton Affentranger 
Chief Executive officer 
Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon 
Switzerland. 
 
 
 
From: Craig L Martin <clmartin@jeci.biz> 
To: “Anton Affentranger”<aaf@implenia.com> 
Sent: Monday, December 26, 2011, 3:13 
Subject: Re: Due Date. 
 
Hello Mr Affentranger, 
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We are deeply sorry for the delay we have caused; we want to assure you that we will have your 
funds sent to you as soon as we can. We are having difficulties in collecting investment funds which 
is slowing down our productions at the moment, this has resulted in our failure to meet up with the 
due date, weendeavour to have the funds sent in as soon as possible. 
 
 
Thanks for your understanding. 
 
 
 
Craig L Martin 
Chief Executive Officer and President  
Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc. 
 
 
 
 
From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
To: “Craig L Martin”<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Friday, December 23, 2011, 9:19 
Subject: Due Date. 
 
Mr Martin, 
 
It has been three weeks past the due date of the loan requested by your company, we have not 
received the outstanding balance or hear from you or your company, however we do request 
payment to be made as agreed on the terms of the loan agreement, send payment promptly. 
 
 
Anton Affentranger 
Chief Executive officer 
Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon 
Switzerland. 
 
 
 
From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
To: “Craig L Martin”<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Tuesday, November 15, 2011, 4:01 
Subject: Re: Wire Slip. 
 
Thank you Mr Martin, Payment received. 
 
 
Anton Affentranger 
Chief Executive officer 
Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon 
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Switzerland. 
 
 
 
 
From: Craig L Martin <clmartin@jeci.biz> 
To: “Anton Affentranger”<aaf@implenia.com> 
Sent: Monday, November 14, 2011, 11:45 
Subject: Wire Slip. 
 
MrAffentranger, 
 
See attached wire slip of payment made out. 
 
 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
Craig L Martin 
Chief Executive Officer and President  
Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc. 
 
 
 
From: Craig L Martin <clmartin@jeci.biz> 
To: “Anton Affentranger”<aaf@implenia.com> 
Sent: Friday, November 11, 2011, 10:13 
Subject: Re: Due date. 
 
Dear Affentranger, 
 
We are sorry for the delay; however, the funds are available and are ready to be wired as soon as 
possible. 
 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
Craig L Martin 
Chief Executive Officer and President  
Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc. 
 
 
 
 
From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
To: “Craig L Martin”<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Thursday, November 10, 2011, 9:16 
Subject: Due Date. 
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Hello Mr Martin, 
 
It is more than one week past the due date of the loan requested by your company and we have not 
received the payment for this month, our creditor wants the payment promptly as agreed on the 
loan agreement. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Anton Affentranger 
Chief Executive officer 
Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon 
Switzerland. 
 
 
 
 
From: Craig L Martin <clmartin@jeci.biz> 
To: “Anton Affentranger”<aaf@implenia.com> 
Sent: Friday, April 8, 2011, 10:13 
Subject: Re: Wire Slip. 
 
Hello Anton, 
 
Thank you for your service to our company. 
 
 
Craig L Martin 
Chief Executive Officer and President  
Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc. 
 
 
 
From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
To: “Craig L Martin”<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Wednesday, April 6, 2011, 9:42 
Subject: Wire slip. 
 
Mr Martin, 
 
We are in receipt of the funds for this month.   
 
Thank you. 
 
Anton Affentranger 
Chief Executive officer 
Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon 
Switzerland. 
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From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
To: “Craig L Martin”<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Thursday, March 3, 2011, 3:21 
Subject: Re: Wire slip. 
 
Hello Martin, 
 
We are in receipt of the funds.   
 
Thank you. 
 
Anton Affentranger 
Chief Executive officer 
Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon 
Switzerland. 
 
 
 
 
From: Craig L Martin <clmartin@jeci.biz> 
To: “Anton Affentranger”<aaf@implenia.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, March 1, 2011, 12:15 
Subject: Wire Slip. 
 
Mr Affentranger, 
 
The payment for the month had been effected, see the wire slip. 
 
 
 
Thank you 
Craig L Martin 
Chief Executive Officer and President  
Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc. 
 
 
 
From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
To: “Craig L Martin”<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Thursday, February 3, 2011, 5:37 
Subject: Re: Wire slip. 
 
Hello Martin, 
 
We are in receipt of the funds.   
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Thank you. 
 
Anton Affentranger 
Chief Executive officer 
Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon 
Switzerland. 
 
 
From: Craig L Martin <clmartin@jeci.biz> 
To: “Anton Affentranger”<aaf@implenia.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, February 2, 2011, 10:10 
Subject: Wire Slip. 
 
Mr Affentranger, 
 
The payment for the month had been effected, see the wire slip. 
 
 
 
Thank you 
Craig L Martin 
Chief Executive Officer and President  
Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
To: “Craig L Martin”<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Friday, January 7, 2011, 3:37 
Subject: Payment Received. 
 
Thanks Mr Martin, 
 
We are in receipt of the funds. 
 
Regards. 
 
Anton Affentranger 
Chief Executive officer 
Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon 
Switzerland. 
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From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
To: “Craig L Martin”<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Wednesday, January 5, 2011, 9:47 
Subject: Re: First instalment. 
 
Thanks Craig, 
 
We will look out for the funds. 
 
Kind regards. 
 
Anton Affentranger 
Chief Executive officer 
Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon 
Switzerland. 
 
 
 
From: Craig L Martin <clmartin@jeci.biz> 
To: “Anton Affentranger”<aaf@implenia.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, January 4, 2011, 3:59 
Subject: Re: First instalment. 
 
Hello Anton, 
 
The payment has been effected, see attached wire receipt for your record keep, we will endeavour 
to make the instalments available before the due date of the loan as promised.  
 
Thanks for your services to our company.  
 
Thank you 
Craig L Martin 
Chief Executive Officer and President  
Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc. 
 
 
 
 
 
From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
To: “Craig L Martin”<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Tuesday, January 4, 2011, 9:40 
Subject: Re: First instalment. 
 
Thank you Mr Martin, 
 
Happy New Year to you too, 
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I have attached a wire instructions for our company's account, we are grateful for the prompt 
payment, have a copy of the wire confirmation slip sent for our record keep. Furthermore, all future 
payments should be made to this account until further notice. 
 
 
Thank you. 
 
Anton Affentranger 
Chief Executive officer 
Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon 
Switzerland. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
From: Craig L Martin <clmartin@jeci.biz> 
To: “Anton Affentranger”<aaf@implenia.com> 
Sent: Monday, January 3, 2011, 10:21 
Subject: First instalment. 
 
Dear Mr Affentranger, 
 
 
Happy New Year, how are you today. On behalf of Jec, Inc. I am happy to inform you that the first 
instalment of 
$676, 941.74 USD is available for your company. We need instructions on how payment should be 
made. 
 
 
Thank you 
Craig L Martin 
Chief Executive Officer and President  
Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc. 
 
 
 
 
From: Craig L Martin <clmartin@jeci.biz> 
To: “Anton Affentranger”<aaf@implenia.com> 
Sent: Monday, November 1, 2010, 3:52 
Subject: Re: Payment slip. 
 
 
Thanks Mr Affentranger, am in receipt of the wire information, on behalf of JEC, Inc. We are very 
grateful for your services. 
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Thank you 
Craig L Martin 
Chief Executive Officer and President  
Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc 
 
 
 
From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
To: “Craig L Martin”<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Monday, November 1, 2010, 9:31 
Subject: Payment slip. 
 
Dear Mr Martin, 
 
See attached a copy of the wire slip for the payment. 
 
Regards, 
 
 
Anton Affentranger 
Chief Executive officer 
Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon 
Switzerland. 
 
 
 
Form: Beat Fellmann<bfellmann@implenia.com> 
To: “Anton Affentranger”aaf@implenia.com 
Sent: Monday, November 1, 2010, 9:04 
Subject: Uberweisungbefestigen. 
 
Herr Affentranger, 
 
Hier ist die uberweisung befestigen. 
 
 
Beat Fellmann 
Chief financial officer 
Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon 
Switzerland. 
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From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
To: “Beat Fellmann” <bfellmann@implenia.com> 
Sent: Thursday, October 28, 2010, 4:27 
Subject: FW: Re: Loan Agreement. 
 
Hallo Beat, 
 
Hier istdir wire instruction von Herr Martin, bitteveranlasse die uberweisung 
Sobaldalsmoglich. 
 
Danke. 
Anton Affentranger 
 
Chief Executive officer 
Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon 
Switzerland. 
 
 
 
 
-------Forwarded Message------- 
From: John W Prosser jr<jwprosser@jeci.biz> 
To: “Anton Affentranger” <aaf@implenia.com> 
Cc: Craig L Martin <clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Monday, October 25, 2010, 10:59 
Subject: Re: Loan Agreement 
 
Mr.Affentranger,  
 
See attached signed agreement and wire instructions from Mr Martin,  
 
Thank You. 
 
John W Prosser jr 
Executive VP: Finance/ Treasurer 
Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc 
 
 
 
 
 
From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
To: “Craig L Martin”<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Friday, October 22, 2010, 2:35 
Subject: Re: Loan Agreement 
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Mr Martin, 
 
Agreement has been attached for your reviewer and signing, once we have received your 
Signed copy of the agreement and the wire instructions, we will proceed with the wire transfer as 
soon as possible. 
 
 
 
Thank you 
Anton Affentranger 
Chief Executive officer 
Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon 
Switzerland. 
 
 
 
 
From: Craig L Martin<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
To: “Anton Affentranger”<aaf@implenia.com> 
Sent: Monday, October 18, 2010, 4:31 
Subject: Re: Loan Agreement 
 
Thank you Mr Affentranger, we await the agreement from you. 
 
 
Thank you 
Craig L Martin 
Chief Executive Officer and President  
Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc 
 
 
 
 
From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
To: “Craig L Martin”<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Monday, October 18, 2010, 2:35 
Subject: Loan Agreement 
 
Hello Mr Martin, 
 
 
Will we get the agreement ready with our signatures within the week and have it sent to your 
attention to sign your part as well and send a copy to us for our record keep before any funds will be 
sent.  
 
Regards, 
 
Thank you 
Anton Affentranger 
Chief Executive officer 
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Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon 
Switzerland. 
 
 
 
From: Craig L Martin<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
To: “Anton Affentranger”<aaf@implenia.com> 
Sent: Thursday, October 14, 2010, 9:31 
Subject: Re: Loan Repayment Schedule. 
 
Dear Mr Affentranger, 
 
Thanks for the schedule sent, payment will be made full with all interest rate as well within the 
period of the loan. Kindly proceed with the loan agreement for our reviewer. 
 
 
 
Thank you 
Craig L Martin 
Chief Executive Officer and President  
Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc 
 
 
 
 
From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
To: “Craig L Martin”<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Wednesday, October 13, 2010, 9:39 
Subject: Loan Repayment Schedule. 
 
Hello MrMartin, 
 
Here is a brief monthly Amortization schedule for your reviewer.  
Let us know if you are happy with it. 

Month Balance interest Principal                         Payment  

1: 03/01/2011 $ 7,950,000.00 $ 26,500.00 $ 650,441.74 $ 676,941.74 

2: 03/02/2011 $ 7,299,558.26 $ 24,331.86 $ 652,609.88 $ 676,941.74 

3: 03/03/2011 $ 6,646,948.38 $ 22,156.49 $ 654,785.24 $ 676,941.74 

4: 03/04/2011 $ 5,992,163.14 $ 19,973.88 $ 656,967.86 $ 676,941.74 

5: 03/05/2011 $ 5,335,195.28 $ 17,783.98 $ 659,157.75 $ 676,941.74 

6: 03/06/2011 $ 4,676,037.53 $ 15,586.79 $ 661,354.95 $ 676,941.74 

7: 03/07/2011  $ 4,014,682.58 $ 13,382.28 $ 663,559.46 $ 676,941.74 

8: 03/08/2011 $ 3,351,123.12 $ 11,170.41 $ 665,771.33 $ 676,941.74 

9: 03/09/2011 $ 2,685,351.79 $ 8,951.17 $ 667,990.57 $ 676,941.74 

10: 03/10/2011 $ 2,017,361.22 $ 6,724.54 $ 670,217.20 $ 676,941.74 
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11: 03/11/2011 $ 1,347,144.02 $ 4,490.48 $ 672,451.26 $ 676,941.74 

12: 03/12/2011 $ 674,692.76 $ 2,248.98 $ 674,692.76 $ 676,941.74 

 
Total payable:$8,123,300.86 USD 

12 monthly payments of: $676,941.74 USD 
Total interest: $173,300.86 USD 
 
Thank you 
Anton Affentranger 
Chief Executive officer 
Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon 
Switzerland 
 
 
 
From: Craig L Martin<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
To: “Anton Affentranger”<aaf@implenia.com> 
Sent: Friday, October 8, 2010, 6:55 
Subject: Re: Request for Loan. 
 
Dear Mr Affentranger, 
 
On behalf of JEC, Inc., we thank you for the positive news.   
The offer is acceptable; proceed with all the necessary documentation. 
 
Thank you 
Craig L Martin 
Chief Executive Officer and President  
Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc 
 
 
 
 
From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
To: “Craig L Martin”<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Monday, October 4, 2010, 1:55 
Subject: Request for Loan. 
 
Hallo Mr Martin, 
 
Our board meeting on Friday had a positive outcome, in regards to your company loan request, we 
are willing to provide the loan to your company, on the requirement that the loan be repaid back 
with monthly interest of 4 %. If your company are in agreement with the percentage, get back to me 
so we can proceed with the loan agreement. 
 
 
Thank you 
Anton Affentranger 
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Chief Executive officer 
Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon 
Switzerland 
 
 
 
From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
To: “Craig L Martin”<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Tuesday, September 28, 2010, 9:18 
Subject: Request for Loan. 
 
Hallo Mr Martin, 
 
Your company loan request of($ 7,950,000.00USD), will be discussed in our board meeting. The 
board meeting will hold on Friday the 1st of October. I will let you know the outcome as soon as 
possible. 
 
Regards, 
 
 
Thank you 
Anton Affentranger 
Chief Executive officer 
Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon 
Switzerland 
 
 
 
From: Craig L Martin<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
To: “Anton Affentranger”<aaf@implenia.com> 
Sent: Monday, September 27, 2010, 7:23 
Subject: Re: Request for Loan. 
 
Dear Mr Affentranger, 
 
Thanks for your response. We required the sum of( $ 7, 950,000.00 USD) in United State dollars to 
boost our investment .Please let me know if your company would be able to loan this amount to our 
company. The loan will be needed for 12 months. 
 
Thank you 
Craig L Martin 
Chief Executive Officer and President  
Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc. 
 
 
 
From: Anton Affentranger<aaf@implenia.com> 
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To: “Craig L Martin”<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
Sent: Friday, September 24, 2010, 11:10 
Subject: Re: Request for Loan. 
 
Hallo Mr Martin, 
 
Just read your email, we might be able to make a loan available; however, I will need you to be more  
Specific of the amount needed, the duration your company wants the loan for. 
 
Kind regards. 
 
Thank you 
Anton Affentranger 
Chief Executive officer 
Implenia  AG 
Industriestrasse 24 
8305 Dietlikon 
Switzerland 
 
 
 
 
 
 
From: Craig L Martin<clmartin@jeci.biz> 
To: “Anton Affentranger”<aaf@implenia.com> 
Sent: Thursday, September 23, 2010, 9:42 
Subject: Request for Loan. 
 
Dear MrAffentranger, 
 
As one of our reputable client, we request a loan from your company on behalf of Jacobs 
Engineering Group, Inc., as you know very well we are a large cooperation, we having some 
difficulties lately with our investment, we need money to fund one of our facility, to boost our 
investments over there for a period of time.  
Kindly let me know if it will be possible. 
 
 
Thank you 
Craig L Martin 
Chief Executive Officer and President  
Jacobs Engineering Group, Inc 
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